
Village of Hoosick Falls Special Meeting 
Wednesday March 30, 2022 

 
6:11pm: Opened the meeting with the Pledge of Allegiance and a Moment 
of Silence 
 
Roll Call: Mayor Allen, Dep. Mayor Ryan, Tr. Alter, Tr. Decker, Tr. 
Walraed all present, Tr. O’Malley and Tr. Pine absent 
 
ARPA Discussion was started with Tr. Decker presenting a slide show with 
the talking points of the allocated categories allowed.  
The board and Atty. Gilchrist all discussed the different options and made a 
list and prioritized them all.  
 
Motion was made to purchase the 5 new computers for the Village office 
by Dep. Mayor Ryan seconded by Tr. Decker all in favor, absent Tr. 
O’Malley and Tr. Pine. 
 
People to be Heard 
 
David Borge and Joe MacDonald from the Armory board spoke about the 
status of the Armory and all the local organizations and people that have 
use of the Armory. They are requesting funds of &15,700 for a ceiling fan 
to be installed in the Perry Room. This fan will help with increasing air 
circulation and air exchange.  
 
Lori Kempf from the Community Youth Center came they are requesting to 
recoup lost revenue of $40,934 so that they can be open more hours these 
funds would be used for employee salaries. 
 
 
 
 
 



Other Business 
 
Resolution to proclaim the Village of Hoosick Falls a Purple Heart Village 
was offered by Dep. Mayor Ryan seconded by Tr. Alter all in favor, absent 
Tr. O’Malley and Tr. Pine 
 
Motion to allow the Mayor to sign the change order from Dan’s Hauling 
for $28,900 was made by Tr. Decker seconded by Dep. Mayor Ryan all in 
favor absent Tr. O’Malley and Tr. Pine. 
 
Motion to have two handicapped signs place in front of the Louis Miller 
Museum at 166 Main St. made by Dep. Mayor Ryan seconded by Tr. 
Decker all in favor absent Tr. O’Malley and Tr. Pine 
 
Motion to adjourn 7:52pm by Dep. Mayor Ryan seconded by Tr. Alter all  
in favor none opposed Tr. O’Malley and Tr. Pine absent. 
 
 


